
170212
12-19-16

3032 3

An ordinance amending Chapter 55, “Dallas Mechanical Code,” of the Dallas City Code, as

amended; adopting with certain changes the 2015 Edition of the International Mechanical Code

of the International Code Council, Inc.; regulating the design, construction, quality of materials,

erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use, and

maintenance of mechanical work in the city; providing a penalty not to exceed $2,000; providing

a saving clause; providing a severability clause; and providing an effective date.

BE IT ORDMNED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DALLAS:

SECTION 1. That Chapter 55, “Dallas Mechanical Code,” of the Dallas City Code, as

amended, is amended by adopting the 2015 Edition of the International Mechanical Code of the

International Code Council, Inc. (which is attached as Exhibit A and made a part of this

ordinance), with the following amendments:

1. Page xi, “Legislation,” is deleted.

2. Chapter 1, “Administration,” of the 2015 International Mechanical Code is deleted and

replaced with a new Chapter 1, “Administration,” to read as follows:

“CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATION

SECTION 101
GENERAL

101.1 Title. These regulations are known as the Dallas Mechanical Code, hereinafter referred to
as “this code.”

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 1



30323 170212
101.2 Scope. This code regulates the design, installation, maintenance, alteration and inspection
of mechanical systems that are permanently installed and utilized to provide control of
environmental conditions and related processes within buildings. This code also regulates those
mechanical systems, system components, equipment and appliances specifically addressed
herein. The installation of fuel gas distribution piping and equipment, fuel gas-fired appliances
and fuel gas-fired appliance venting systems are regulated by the Dallas Fuel Gas Code.

Exceptions:

1. Detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings
(townhouses) not more than three stories high with separate means of egress and their
accessory structures must comply with the Dallas One- and Two-Family Dwelling
Code.

2. Mechanical systems in existing buildings undergoing repair, alterations, or additions,
and change of occupancy may comply with the Dallas Existing Building Code.

101.3 Administrative procedures. Except as otherwise specified in this code, all provisions of
Chapter 52, “Administrative Procedures for the Construction Codes,” of the Dallas City Code
apply to this code.

101.4 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code are
considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference
only when such codes and standards have been specifically adopted by the city of Dallas.
Whenever amendments have been adopted to the referenced codes and standards, each reference
to the codes and standards is considered to reference the amendments as well. Any reference
made to NFPA 70 or the ICC Electrical Code means the Dallas Electrical Code, as amended.
References made to the International Plumbing Code, the International Building Code, the
International Fire Code, the International Energy Conservation Code, the International Fuel
Gas Code, the International Existing Building Code, and the International Residential Code,
respectively mean the Dallas Plumbing Code, the Dallas Building Code, the Dallas Fire Code,
the Dallas Energy Conservation Code, the Dallas Fuel Gas Code, the Dallas Existing Building
Code, and the Dallas One- and Two-Family Dwelling Code, as amended.

Exception: Where enforcement of a code provision would violate the conditions of the
listing of the equipment or appliance, the conditions of the listing and the manufacturer’s
instructions apply.”

3. The definition of “Environmental Air,” in Section 202, “General Definitions,” of

Chapter 2, “Definitions,” of the 2015 International Mechanical Code is amended to read as

follows:

“ENVIRONMENTAL AIR. Air that is conveyed to or from occupied areas through ducts
which are not part of the heating or air-conditioning system, such as ventilation for human usage,

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 2



30323 170212
domestic kitchen range exhaust, bathroom exhaust, domestic clothes dryer exhaust [and parking
garage exhaust].”

4. Subsection 304.3, “Elevation of Ignition Source,” of Section 304, “Installation,”

of Chapter 3, “General Regulations,” of the 2015 International Mechanical Code is amended to

read as follows:

“304.3 Elevation of ignition source. Equipment and appliances having an ignition source and
located in hazardous locations and public garages, private garages, repair garages, automotive
motor fuel-dispensing facilities and parking garages shall be elevated such that the source of
ignition is not less than 18 inches (457 mm) above the floor surface on which the equipment or
appliance rests. For the purpose of this section, rooms or spaces that are not part of the living
space of a dwelling unit and that communicate directly with a private garage through openings
shall be considered to be part of the private garage.

Exceptions:

1. Elevation of the ignition source is not required for appliances that are listed as
flammable vapor ignition resistant.

Electric appliances.

304.3.1 Parking garages. Connection of a parking garage with any room in which there is a
fuel-fired appliance shall be by means of a vestibule providing a two-doorway separation,
except that a single door is permitted where the sources of ignition in the appliance are
elevated in accordance with Section 304.3.

Exception: This section shall not apply to appliance installations complying with Section
304.6.”

5. Subsection 304.7, “Private Garages,” of Section 304, “Installation,” of Chapter 3,

“General Regulations,” of the 2015 International Mechanical Code is deleted.

6. Subsection 306.3, “Appliances in Attics,” of Section 306, “Access and Service

Space,” of Chapter 3, “General Regulations,” of the 2015 International Mechanical Code is

amended to read as follows:

“306.3 Appliances in attics. Attics containing appliances requiring access shall be provided
with an opening and unobstructed passageway large enough to allow removal of the largest
appliance. The passageway shall not be less than 30 inches (762 mm) high and 22 inches (559
mm) wide and not more than 20 feet (6096 mm) in length measured along the centerline of the

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 3



30323 170212
passageway from the opening to the ‘appliance. The passageway shall have continuous solid
flooring not less than 24 inches (610 mm) wide. A level service space not less than 30 inches
(762 mm) deep and 30 inches (762 mm) wide shall be present at the front or service side of the
appliance. The clear access opening dimensions shall be not less than 20 inches by 30 inches
(508 mm by 762 mm) or larger where such dimensions are not[, and] large enough to allow
removal of the largest appliance. A walkway to an appliance must be rated as a floor as
approved by the building official. At a minimum, one of the following must be provided for
access to the attic space:

1. A permanent stair.

1 A pull down stair with a minimum 300 lb (136 kg’) capacity.

3. An access door from an upper floor level.

Due to structural conditions, an access panel may be used in lieu of items 1, 2 or 3 with the prior
approval of the building official.

Exceptions:

1. The passageway and level service space are not required where the appliance is
capable of being serviced and removed through the required opening.

2. Where the passageway is unobstructed and not less than 6 feet (1829 mm) high and
22 inches (559 mm) wide for its entire length, the passageway shall be not greater
than 50 feet (15 250 mm) in length.

306.3.1 Electrical requirements. A luminaire controlled by a switch located at the required
passageway opening and a receptacle outlet shall be provided at or near the appliance
location in accordance with the Dallas Electric Code. Low voltage wiring of 50 volts or less
must be installed in an approved manner as defined in the Dallas Electrical Code in order to
prevent physical damage to the wiring [NFPA-7-0].”

7. Subsection 306.5, “Equipment and Appliances on Roofs or Elevated Structures,”

of Section 306, “Access and Service Space,” of Chapter 3, “General Regulations,” of the 2015

International Mechanical Code is amended to read as follows:

“306.5 Equipment and appliances on roofs or elevated structures. Where equipment
requiring access or appliances are located on an elevated structure or the roof of a building such
that personnel will have to climb higher than 16 feet (4877 mm) above grade to access a
permanent [such equipment or appliances, an] interior or exterior means of access shall be
provided. Permanent exterior ladders providing roof access need not extend closer than 12 feet
(2438 mm) to the finish grade or floor level below and must extend to the equipment and
appliances’ level service space. Such access shall not require climbing over obstructions greater
than 30 inches (762 mm) in height or walking on roofs having a slope greater than 4 units

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 4



30323 170212
vertical in 12 units horizontal (33-percent slope). Such access shall not require the use of
portable ladders. Where access involves climbing over parapet walls, the height shall be
measured to the top of the parapet wall.

Permanent ladders installed to provide the required access shall comply with the following
minimum design criteria:

1. The side railing shall extend above the parapet or roof edge not less than 30 inches (762
mm).

2. Ladders shall have rung spacing not to exceed 14 inches (356 mm) on center. The
uppermost rung shall be not greater than 24 inches (610 mm) below the upper edge of the
roof hatch, roof or parapet, as applicable.

3. Ladders shall have a toe spacing not less than 6 inches (152 mm) deep.

4. There shall be not less than 18 inches (457 mm) between rails.

5. Rungs shall have a minimum 0.75-inch (19 mm) diameter and be capable of withstanding
a 300-pound (136.1 kg) load.

6. Ladders over 30 feet (9144 mm) in height shall be provided with offset sections and
landings capable of withstanding 100 pounds per square foot (488.2 kg/rn2). Landing
dimensions shall be not less than 18 inches (457 mm) and not less than the width of the
ladder served. A guard rail shall be provided on all open sides of the landing.

7. Climbing clearance. The distance from the centerline on the rungs to the nearest
permanent object on the climbing side of the ladder shall be not less than 30 inches (762
mm) measured perpendicular to the rungs. This distance shall be maintained from the
point of ladder access to the bottom of the roof hatch. A minimum clear width of 15-
inches (381 mm) shall be provided on both sides of the ladder measured from midpoint of
and parallel with the rungs except where cages or wells are installed.

8. Landing required. The ladder shall be provided with a clear and unobstructed bottom
landing area having a minimum dimension of 30 inches (762 mm) by 30 inches (762
mm) centered in front of the ladder.

9. Ladders shall be protected against corrosion by approved means.

10. Access to ladders shall be provided at all times.

Catwalks installed to provide the required access shall be not less than 24 inches (610 mm)
wide and shall have railings as required for service platforms.

Exception: This section shall not apply to Group R-3 occupancies.

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 5



30323 170212
306.5.1 Sloped roofs. Where appliances, equipment, fans or other components that require
service are installed on [] roofs having [] slopes greater than four [of three] units vertical in
12 units horizontal (33[4]-percent slope) [or greater] and having an edge more than 30
inches (762 mm) above grade at such edge, a catwalk at least 16 inches (406.4 mm) in width
with substantial cleats spaced not more than 16 inches (406.4 mm) apart must be provided
from the roof access to a level platform at the appliance. The level platform shall be provided
on each side of the appliance or equipment to which access is required for service, repair or
maintenance. The platform shall be not less than 30 inches (762 mm) in any dimension and
shall be provided with guards. The guards shall extend not less than 42 inches (1067 mm)
above the platform, shall be constructed so as to prevent the passage of a 21-inch diameter
(533 mm) sphere and shall comply with the loading requirements for guards specified in the
Dallas [International] Building Code. Access shall not require walking on roofs having a
slope greater than four units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33-percent slope). Where access
involves obstructions greater than 30 inches (762 mm) in height, such obstructions shall be
provided with ladders installed in accordance with Section 306.5 or stairways installed in
accordance with the requirements specified in the Dallas [International] Building Code in the
path of travel to and from appliances, fans or equipment requiring service.

306.5.2 Electrical requirements. A receptacle outlet shall be provided at or near the
equipment location in accordance with the Dallas Electrical Code [NFPA 70].”

8. Section 306, “Access and Service Space,” of Chapter 3, “General Regulations,” of

the 2015 International Mechanical Code is amended by adding a new Subsection 306.6, “Water

Heaters Above Ground or Floor,” to read as follows:

“306.6 Water heaters above ground or floor. When the attic, roof, mezzanine or platform in
which a water heater is installed is more than 8 feet (2438 mm) above the ground or floor level, it
must be made accessible by a stairway or permanent ladder fastened to the building.

Exception: A water heater may be reached by portable ladder if the water heater has a
capacity of no more than 10 gallons (or larger with prior approval), it is capable of being
accessed through a lay-in ceiling, and it is installed not more than 10 feet (3048 mm) above
the ground or floor level.

306.6.1. Illumination and convenience outlet. Whenever the attic, roof, mezzanine or
platform is not adequately lighted or access to a receptacle outlet is not obtainable from the
main level, lighting and a receptacle outlet must be provided in accordance with Section
306.3.1.”

9. Subsection 307.2, “Evaporators and Cooling Coils,” of Section 307, “Condensate

Disposal,” of Chapter 3, “General Regulations,” of the 2015 International Mechanical Code is

amended to read as follows:

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 6



30323 170212
“307.2 Evaporators and cooling coils. Condensate drain systems shall be provided for
equipment and appliances containing evaporators or cooling coils. Condensate drain systems
shall be designed, constructed and installed in accordance with Sections 307.2.1 through 307.2.5.

Exception: Evaporators and cooling coils that are designed to operate in sensible cooling
only and not support condensation shall not be required to meet the requirements of this
section.

307.2.1 Condensate disposal. Condensate from all cooling coils and evaporators shall be
conveyed from the drain pan [outlet] to an approved place of disposal. Such piping shall
maintain a minimum horizontal slope in the direction of discharge of not less than one-eighth
unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (1-percent slope). Condensate shall not discharge into a
street, alley, sidewalk, rooftop or other areas so as to cause a nuisance.

307.2.2 Drain pipe materials and sizes. Components of the condensate disposal system
shall be cast iron, galvanized steel, copper, cross-linked polyethylene, polyethylene, ABS,
CPVC, PVC, or polypropylene pipe or tubing. When exposed to ultra violet light, schedule
80 PVC pipe or tubing is required. Components shall be selected for the pressure [an4]
temperature, and exposure rating of the installation. Joints and connections shall be made in
accordance with the applicable provisions of Chapter 7 of the Dallas [International]
Plumbing Code relative to the material type. Condensate waste and drain line size shall be
not less than3%-inch (19.1 mm) internal diameter and shall not decrease in size from the drain
pan connection to the place of condensate disposal. Where the drain pipes from more than
one unit are manifolded together for condensate drainage, the pipe or tubing shall be sized in
accordance with Table 307.2.2.

307.2.3 Auxiliary and secondary drain systems. In addition to the requirements of Section
307.2.1, where damage to any building components could occur as a result of overflow from
the equipment primary condensate removal system, one of the following auxiliary protection
methods shall be provided for each cooling coil or fuel-fired appliance that produces
condensate:

1. An auxiliary drain pan with a separate drain shall be provided under the coils on
which condensation will occur. The auxiliary pan drain shall discharge to a
conspicuous point of disposal to alert occupants in the event of a stoppage of the
primary drain. The pan shall have a minimum depth of 1 ½ inches (38 mm), shall not
be less than 3 inches (76 mm) larger than the unit, or the coil dimensions in width and
length and shall be constructed of corrosion-resistant material. Galvanized sheet steel
pans shall have a minimum thickness of not less than 0.0236 inch (0.60 10 mm) (No.
24 gage). Nonmetallic pans shall have a minimum thickness of not less than 0.0625
inch (1.6 mm).

2. A separate overflow drain line shall be connected to the drain pan provided with the
equipment. Such overflow drain shall discharge to a conspicuous point of disposal to
alert occupants in the event of a stoppage of the primary drain. The overflow drain
line shall connect to the drain pan at a higher level than the primary drain connection.

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 7



30323 170212
However, the conspicuous point must not create a hazard such as dripping over a
street, alley, sidewalk, rooftop or other areas so as to create a nuisance.

3. An auxiliary drain pan without a separate drain line shall be provided under the coils
on which condensate will occur. Such pan shall be equipped with a water-level
detection device conforming to UL 508 that will shut off the equipment served prior
to overflow of the pan. The auxiliary drain pan shall be constructed in accordance
with Item 1 of this section. A water level detection device may be installed only with
prior approval of the building official.

4. A water level detection device conforming to UL 508 shall be provided that will shut
off the equipment served in the event that the primary drain is blocked. The device
shall be installed in the primary drain line, the overflow drain line, or in the
equipment-supplied drain pan, located at a point higher than the primary drain line
connection and below the overflow rim of such pan. A water level detection device
may be installed only with prior approval of the building official.

Exception: Fuel-fired appliances that automatically shut down operation in the event of
a stoppage in the condensate drainage system.

307.2.3.1 Water-level monitoring devices. On down-flow units and all other coils that
do not have a secondary drain or provisions to install a secondary or auxiliary drain pan,
a water-level monitoring device shall be installed inside the primary drain pan. This
device shall shut off the equipment served in the event that the primary drain becomes
restricted. Devices installed in the drain line shall not be permitted. A water level
detection device may be installed only with prior approval of the building official.

307.2.3.2 Appliances, equipment and insulation in pans. Where appliances,
equipment or insulation are subject to water damage when auxiliary drain pans fill, that
portion of the appliance, equipment and insulation shall be installed above the rim of the
pan. Supports located inside of the pan to support the appliance or equipment shall be
water resistant and approved.

307.2.4 Traps. Condensate drains shall be trapped as required by the equipment or
appliance manufacturer.

307.2.4.1 Ductless mini-split system traps. Ductless mini-split equipment that produces
condensate shall be provided with an inline check valve located in the drain line, or a
trap.

307.2.5 Drain line maintenance. Condensate drain lines shall be configured to permit
the clearing of blockages and performance of maintenance without requiring the drain
line to be cut.

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 8



30323 170212

10. Paragraph 403.2.1, “Recirculation of Air,” of Subsection 403.2, “Outdoor Air

Required,” of Section 403, “Mechanical Ventilation,” of Chapter 4, “Ventilation,” of the 2015

International Mechanical Code is amended to read as follows:

“403.2.1 Recirculation of air. The outdoor air required by Section 403.3 shall not be
recirculated. Air in excess of that required by Section 403.3 shall not be prohibited from
being recirculated as a component of supply air to building spaces, except that:

1. Ventilation air shall not be recirculated from one dwelling to another or to dissimilar
occupancies.

2. Supply air to a swimming pool and associated deck areas shall not be recirculated
unless such air is dehumidified to maintain the relative humidity of the area at 60
percent or less. Air from this area shall not be recirculated to other spaces where
more than 10 percent of the resulting supply airstream consists of air recirculated
from these spaces.

3. Where mechanical exhaust is required by Note b in Table 403.3.1.1, recirculation of
air from such spaces shall be prohibited. Recirculation of air that is contained
completely within such spaces shall not be prohibited. Where recirculation of air is
prohibited, all air supplied to such spaces shall be exhausted, including any air in
excess of that required by Table 403.3.1.1.

4. Where mechanical exhaust is required by Note g in Table 403.3.1.1, mechanical
exhaust is required and recirculation from such spaces is prohibited where more than
10 percent of the resulting supply airstream consists of air recirculated from these
spaces. Recirculation of air that is contained completely within such spaces shall not
be prohibited.

Toilet rooms within private dwellings that contain only a water closet, lavatory or
combination thereof may be ventilated with an approved mechanical recirculating fan
or similar device designed to remove odors from the air.”

11. Subsection 501.3, “Exhaust Discharge,” of Section 501, “General,” of Chapter 5,

“Exhaust Systems,” of the 2015 International Mechanical Code is amended to read as follows:

“501.3 Exhaust discharge. The air removed by every mechanical exhaust system shall be
discharged outdoors at a point where it will not cause a public nuisance and not less than the
distances specified in Section 501.3.1. The air shall be discharged to a location from which it
cannot again be readily drawn in by a ventilating system. Air shall not be exhausted into an attic,
crawl space, or be directed onto walkways.

Exceptions:

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 9



30323 17021.2

1. Whole-house ventilation-type attic fans shall be permitted to discharge into the attic
space of dwelling units having private attics.

2. Commercial cooking recirculating systems.

3. Where installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions and where
mechanical or natural ventilation is otherwise provided in accordance with Chapter 4,
listed and labeled domestic ductless range hoods shall not be required to discharge to
the outdoors.

4.. Toilet room exhaust ducts may terminate in a warehouse or shop area when
infiltration of outside air is present.

501.3.1 Location of exhaust outlets. The termination point of exhaust outlets and ducts
discharging to the outdoors shall be located with the following minimum distances:

1. For ducts conveying explosive or flammable vapors, fumes or dusts: 30 feet (9144
mm) from property lines; 10 feet (3048 mm) from operable openings into buildings; 6
feet (1829 mm) from exterior walls and roofs; 30 feet (9144 mm) from combustible
walls and operable openings into buildings which are in the direction of the exhaust
discharge; 10 feet (3048 mm) above adjoining grade.

2. For other product-conveying outlets, including but not limited to enclosed parking
garage, loading dock, and motor vehicle repair garage exhaust outlets: 10 feet (3048
mm) from the property lines; 3 feet (914 mm) from exterior walls and roofs; 10 feet
(3048 mm) from operable openings into buildings; 10 feet (3048 mm) above
adjoining grade.

3. For all environmental air exhaust: 3 feet (914 mm) from property lines; 3 feet (914
mm) from operable openings into buildings for all occupancies other than Group U,
and 10 feet (3048 mm) from mechanical air intakes. Such exhaust shall not be
considered hazardous or noxious.

4. Exhaust outlets serving structures in flood hazard areas shall be installed at or above
the elevation required by Section 1612 of the Dallas [International] Building Code
for utilities and attendant equipment.

5. For specific systems see the following sections:

5.1. Clothes dryer exhaust, Section 504.4.

5.2. Kitchen hoods and other kitchen exhaust equipment, Section 506.3.13, 506.4
and 506.5.

5.3. Dust stock and refuse conveying systems, Section 511.2.

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 10



30323 170212

5.4. Subsiab soil exhaust systems, Section 512.4.

5.5. Smoke control systems, Section 5 13.10.3.

5.6. Refrigerant discharge, Section 1105.7.

5.7. Machinery room discharge, Section 1105.6.1.

501.3.2 Exhaust opening protection. Exhaust openings that terminate outdoors shall be
protected with corrosion-resistant screens, louvers or grilles. Openings in screens, louvers
and grills shall be sized not less than ‘/4 inch (6.4 mm) and not larger than ½ inch (12.7 mm).
Openings shall be protected against local weather conditions. Louvers that protect exhaust
openings in structures located in hurricane-prone regions, as defined in the Dallas
[Intcl7iatiolzal] Building Code, shall comply with AMCA Standard 550. Outdoor openings
located in exterior walls shall meet the provisions for exterior wall opening protectives in
accordance with the Dallas [hiternational] Building Code.”

12. Paragraph 504.8.2, “Duct Installation,” of Subsection 504.8, “Domestic Clothes

Dryer Ducts,” of Section 504, “Clothes Dryer Exhaust,” of Chapter 5, “Exhaust Systems,” of the

2015 International Mechanical Code is amended to read as follows:

“504.8.2 Duct installation. Exhaust ducts shall be supported at 4-foot (1219 mm) intervals
and secured in place. The insert end of the duct shall extend into the adjoining duct or fitting
in the direction of airflow. Ducts shall not be joined with screws or similar fasteners [th
protrude more than 1/8 inch (3.2 mm) into the inside of the duct].”

13. Subsection 505.1, “Domestic Systems,” of Section 505, “Domestic Kitchen

Exhaust Equipment,” of Chapter 5, “Exhaust Systems,” of the 2015 International Mechanical

Code is amended to read as follows:

“505.1 Domestic systems. Where domestic range hoods and domestic appliances equipped with
downdraft exhaust are provided within dwelling units, such hoods and appliances shall discharge
to the outdoors through sheet metal ducts constructed of galvanized steel, stainless steel,
aluminum or copper. Such ducts shall have smooth inner walls, shall be air tight, shall be
equipped with a backdraft damper, and shall be independent of all other exhaust systems.

Exceptions:

1. [In other than Group I 1 and I 2,] W[w]here installed in accordance with the
manufacturer’s instructions and where mechanical or natural ventilation is otherwise
provided in accordance with Chapter 4, listed and labeled ductless range hoods shall
not be required to discharge to the outdoors.

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 11



30323 170212

2. Ducts for domestic kitchen cooking appliances equipped with downdraft exhaust
systems shall be permitted to be constructed of Schedule 40 Pvc pipe and fittings
provided that the installation complies with all of the following:

2.1. The duct shall be installed under a concrete slab poured on grade.

2.2. The underfloor trench in which the duct is installed shall be completely
backfilled with sand or gravel.

2.3. The vc duct shall extend not more than 1 inch (25 mm) above the indoor
concrete floor surface.

2.4. The vc duct shall extend not more than 1 inch (25 mm) above grade
outside of the building.

2.5. The vc ducts shall be solvent cemented.”

14. Subsection 505.3, “common Exhaust Systems for Domestic Kitchens Located in

Multistory Structures,” of Section 505, “Domestic Kitchen Exhaust Equipment,” of chapter 5,

“Exhaust Systems,” of the 2015 International Mechanical code is amended to read as follows:

“505.3 Common exhaust systems for domestic kitchens located in residential multistory
structures. Where a common multistory duct system is designed and installed to convey exhaust
from multiple domestic kitchen exhaust systems in a residential multistory structure, the
construction of the system shall be in accordance with all of the following:

1. The shaft in which the duct is installed shall be constructed and fire-resistance rated as
required by the Dallas [International] Building Code.

2. Dampers shall be prohibited in the exhaust duct, except as specified in Section 505.1.
Penetrations of the shaft and ductwork shall be protected in accordance with Section
607.5.5, Exception 2.

3. Rigid metal ductwork shall be installed within the shaft to convey the exhaust. The
ductwork shall be constructed of sheet steel having a minimum thickness of 0.0 187 inch
(0.4712 mm)(No. 26 gage) and in accordance with SMACNA Duct Construction
Standards.

4. The ductwork within the shaft shall be designed and installed without offsets.

5. The exhaust fan motor design shall be in accordance with Section 503.2.

6. The exhaust fan motor shall be located outside of the airstream.

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 12



30323 170212

7. The exhaust fan shall run continuously, and shall be connected to a standby power
source.

8. Exhaust fan operation shall be monitored in an approved location and shall initiate an
audible or visual signal when the fan is not in operation.

9. Where the exhaust rate for an individual kitchen exceeds 400 cfm (0.19 m3/s) makeup air
shall be provided in accordance with Section 505.2.

10. A cleanout opening shall be located at the base of the shaft to provide access to the duct
to allow for cleanout and inspection. The finished openings shall be not less than 12
inches by 12 inches (305 mm by 305 mm).

11. Screens shall not be installed at the termination.

12. The common residential multistory duct system shall serve only kitchen exhaust and shall
be independent of other exhaust systems.”

15. Subsection 505.4, “Other Than Group R,” of Section 505, “Domestic Kitchen

Exhaust Equipment,” of Chapter 5, “Exhaust Systems,” of the 2015 International Mechanical

Code is deleted.

16. Paragraph [BF] 607.5.1, “Fire Walls,” of Subsection [BF] 607.5, “Where Required,”

of Section 607, “Duct and Transfer Openings,” of Chapter 6, “Duct Systems,” of the 2015

International Mechanical Code is amended to read as follows:

“[BF] 607.5.1 Fire walls. Ducts and air transfer openings permitted in fire walls in
accordance with Section 706.11 of the Dallas [International] Building Code shall be
protected with listed fire dampers installed in accordance with their listing. For hazardous
exhaust systems see Section 510.

[BFJ 607.5.1.1 Horizontal exits. A listed smoke damper designed to resist the passage
of smoke shall be provided at each point that a duct or air transfer opening penetrates a
fire wall that serves as a horizontal exit.”

17. The ASHRAE standards of Chapter 15, “Referenced Standards,” of the 2015

International Mechanical Code are amended to read as follows:

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 13



30323 170212

“ASHRAE ASHRAE
1791 Tullie Circle, NE
Atlanta, GA 30329

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
ASHRAE—201 3 ASHRAE Fundamentals Handbook 603.2
15—2013 Safety Standard for Refrigeration Systems 1101.6, 1105.8, 1108.1
34—2013 Designation and Safety Classification of Refrigerants 202, 1 102.2.1, 1103.1
62.1—2013 Ventilation for Acceptable Indoor Air Quality 403.3.1.1.2.3.2
170—2008 Ventilation of Health Care Facilities 407
[180 2012 Standard Practice for Inspection and Maintcnancc of Commercial

Building HVAC Systems 102.3]”

18. The NFPA standards of Chapter 15, “Referenced Standards,” of the 2015

International Mechanical Code are amended to read as follows:

“NFPA National Fire Protection Associtaion
1 Batterymarch Park
Quincy, MA 02269-9 101

Standard Referenced
reference in code
number Title section number
30A—15 Code for Motor Fuel-dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages 304.6
31—11 Standard for the Installation of Oil-burning Equipment 701.1, 801.2.1, 801.18.1,

801.18.2, 920.2, 922.1, 1308.1
37—14 Standard for the Installation and Use of Stationary Combustion

Engines and Gas Turbines 915.1, 915.2
58—14 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code 502.9.10
69—14 Standard on Explosion Prevention Systems 5 10.9.3
70—14 National Electrical Code 301.7, [306.3.1,] 306.4.1, 511.1.1,

513.11,513.12.2, 602.2.1.1, 927.2, 1104.2.2, 1106.3, 1106.4
72—13 National Fire Alarm Signaling Code 606.3
82—14 Standard on Incinerators and Waste and Linen Handling Systems and Equipment 601.1
85—15 Boiler and Combustion Systems Hazards Code 1004.1
91—15 Standard for Exhaust Systems for Air Conveying of Vapors, Gases, Mists and

Noncombustible Particulate Solids 502.9.5.1, 502.17
92—15 Standard for Smoke Control Systems 513.7, 513.8
96—14 Standard for Ventilation Control and Fire Protection of

Commercial Cooking Operations 507.1
211—13 Standard for Chimneys, Fireplaces, Vents and Solid Fuel-burning Appliances 806.1
262—15 Standard Method of Test for Flame Travel and Smoke of Wires and

Cables for Use in Air-handling Spaces 602.2.1.1
286—15 Standard Methods of Fire Tests for Evaluating Contribution of Wall and

Ceiling Interior Finish to Room Fire Growth 602.2.1.6.2
704—12 Standard System for Identification of the Hazards of Materials for

Emergency Response 502.8.4, Table 1103.1, 510.1
853—15 Standard on Installation of Stationary Fuel Power Plants 924.1

19. Appendix A of the 2015 International Mechanical Code is adopted.

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 14



30323 170212
20. Appendix B of the 2015 International Mechanical Code is not adopted.

21. All chapters of the 2015 International Mechanical Code adopted by this ordinance

are subchapters of Chapter 55 of the Dallas City Code, as amended.

22. All references in the 2015 International Mechanical Code to the fire code,

building code, plumbing code, electrical code, residential code, existing building code, energy

conservation code, fuel gas code, and green construction code refer, respectively to Chapters 16,

53, 54, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, and 61 of the Dallas City Code.

SECTION 2. That a person violating a provision of this ordinance, upon conviction, is

punishable by a fine not to exceed $2,000. No offense committed and no liability, penalty, or

forfeiture, either civil or criminal, incurred prior to the effective date of this ordinance will be

discharged or affected by this ordinance. Prosecutions and suits for such offenses, liabilities,

penalties, and forfeitures may be instituted, and causes of action pending on the effective date of

this ordinance may proceed, as if the former laws applicable at the time the offense, liability,

penalty, or forfeiture was conmiitted or incurred had not been amended, repealed, reenacted, or

superseded, and all former laws will continue in effect for these purposes.

SECTION 3. That Chapter 55 of the Dallas City Code, as amended, will remain in full

force and effect, save and except as amended by this ordinance. Any existing structure, system,

development project, or registration that is not required to come into compliance with a

requirement of this ordinance will be governed by the requirement as it existed in the former law

last applicable to the structure, system, development project, or registration, and all former laws

will continue in effect for this purpose.

SECTION 4. That the terms and provisions of this ordinance are severable and are governed

by Section 1-4 of Chapter 1 of the Dallas City Code, as amended.

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 15



30323 170212
SECTION 5. That this ordinance will take effect on March 1, 2017, and it is accordingly so

ordained.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

LARR E. ASTO Ci y Attorney

By
cistantcAttorney

JAN 252017
Passed______________________________________

Chapter 55 — Dallas Mechanical Code (adopt 2015 International Mechanical Code) - Page 16



PROOF OF PUBLICATION - LEGAL ADVERTISING

The legal advertisement required for the noted ordinance was published in
the Dallas Morning News, the official newspaper of the city, as required by
law, and the Dallas City Charter, Chapter XVIII, Section 7.

DATE ADOPTED BY CITY COUNCIL JAN 252017

OFFICE OF CITY SECRETARY
P:\PROOF OF PUBLICATION.docx

ORDINANCE NUMBER

DATE PUBLISHED

30323

JAN 2 8 2017

ATTESTED BY:


